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Quarter Highlights (October to December 2023)

Dear Respected Member,
ITU-APT Foundation of India (IAFI) is delighted to share about the quarterly activities.

WRC-23 – the most successful event of the ITU, WRC-23, shaping the future of
communication and empowering women: ITU’s mega event, World Radiocommunication
Conference 2023 (WRC-23) was held at Dubai from 20th November, 2023 to 15th December,
marking a pivotal moment for the global wireless communication. The conference was hosted by
the Telecommunications and Digital Government Regulatory Authority (TDRA) of the UAE. Member
states tackled intricate questions of spectrum allocation, ultimately achieving remarkable progress,
revising the ITU Radio Regulations to support spectrum sharing and technological innovation,
updated treaty, allocates new spectrum for broadband connectivity, safety of life, space and earth
observation. WRC-23 puts the world on a solid path towards a more connected, sustainable,
equitable and inclusive digital future for all. Few major decisions were taken during WRC-23 are as
following.

1. WRC-23 identified spectrum for International Mobile Telecommunications (IMT), which will be
crucial for expanding broadband connectivity and developing IMT mobile services, also known as
4G, 5G and, in the future, 6G. That new spectrum includes the 3 300-3 400 megahertz (MHz), 3
600-3 800 MHz, 4 800-4 990 MHz and 6 425-7 125 MHz frequency bands in various countries and
regions. The WRC also recognised the use of 6425 to 7125 MHz for wireless access and RLANS in
the Radio Regulation table of frequency allocations for the first time.

2. WRC-23 also approved new studies for identification of IMT in 4.4-4.8 GHz, 7-8 GHz and 15 GHz
for additional 2 GHz mid band spectrum for 4G, 5G and 6G at WRC-27.

3. WRC-23 identified a number of IMT bands below 2.7 GHz for use of high-altitude platform
stations for IMT base stations (HIBS) and established regulations for their operations. It offers a
new platform to provide mobile broadband using the same frequencies and devices as IMT mobile
networks. HIBS can contribute to bridging the digital divide in remote and rural areas and maintain
connectivity during disasters.

4. For non-geostationary fixed-satellite service Earth Stations in Motion (ESIMs), WRC-23 identified
new frequencies to deliver high-speed broadband on-board aircraft, vessels, trains, and vehicles.
These satellite services are also critical during disasters where local communication infrastructure
is damaged or destroyed.

5. To support the modernization of the Global Maritime Distress and Safety System (GMDSS),
WRC-23 took regulatory actions including the implementation of e-navigation systems to enhance
distress and safety communications at sea.

6. It was also decided to protect ship and aircraft mobile service stations located in international
airspace and waters from other stations within national territories.

7. WRC-23 allocated new frequencies to the aviation industry for aeronautical mobile satellite
services (117.975-137 MHz).

8. WRC-23 agreed to allocate additional frequencies for passive Earth exploration satellite services
to enable advanced ice cloud measurements for better weather forecasting and climate monitoring.

9. WRC-23 agreed to allocate frequency bands 15.41-15.7 GHz and 22-22.2 GHz in Radio
Regulations Region 1 and some Region 3 countries for non-safety aeronautical applications. This
will enable aircraft, helicopters, and drones to carry sophisticated aeronautical digital equipment for
purposes such as surveillance, monitoring, mapping, and filming, and have the capacity to transfer
large data from these applications using wideband radio links.

10. WRC-23 agreed for the importance of space weather observation in a new Resolution and a
new Article in the Radio Regulations to recognize the operation of space weather sensors as part of
the meteorological aid service to observe space weather phenomena including solar flares, solar
radiation and geomagnetic storms which can interfere with radio- communication services including
satellites, mobile phone services and navigation systems.

11. WRC-23 agreed for the development of regulatory measures to limit the unauthorized
operations of non-geostationary-satellite orbit (non-GSO) earth stations in the fixed-satellite service
(FSS) and mobile-satellite service (MSS). It was also agreed to develop technical and regulatory
measures for fixed satellite systems (FSS) while taking into account the specific needs of
developing countries including the need for equitable access to the relevant frequency bands.

12. WRC-23 approved the recommendation of the Radio Regulations Board to allow 41 countries to
acquire new and usable orbital resources for satellite broadcasting. The countries were unable to
use their assigned orbital slots in recent years due to factors such as lack of coordination and
interference from other satellite networks.

13. It was also agreed for allocations to a possible new or modified space research service (space-
to-space) for future development of communications on the lunar surface, and between lunar orbit
and the lunar surface. In all, WRC-23 approved of 43 new resolutions, revised 56 existing ones,
and suppressed 33 resolutions and also approved the agenda items for the next World
Radiocommunication Conference (WRC- 27) and the provisional agenda for WRC-31. In addition to
the above, many more decisions were taken during WRC-23. The conference proved to be the
most successful event, as it brought out significant results that will contribute to the advancement of
numerous radio services, serving the interests of countries, societies, and humanity at large.
Another landmark achievement of the WRC-23 was the 22% representation of women among
delegates, marking a 4-percentage-point climb since 2019, surge in female participation marks a
crucial step towards gender parity in the critical arena of radio- communication.

Hectic third week at WRC-23 to tackle diverse Agenda Items and achievements made after
third week of the WRC-23: The ITU's flagship event, WRC-23, had passed its three-quarter mark,
which marked the entry into its final phase. The conference covered almost all the current agenda
items and completed detailed discussions on new ones for WRC-27/31. The third week of WRC-23
proved highly active for all three committees, 4, 5, and 6, as discussed and reviewed wide range of
agenda items, covering the following topics.

a. Mobile broadband issues (Agenda Items 1.1, 1.2, 1.3, 1.4 and 1.5)

b. Satellite communication and Earth observation (Items 1.15, 1.16, and 1.17)

c. Aeronautical and maritime radio-communication (Items 1.6, and 1.7, 1.11, 1.13)

d. Spectrum management and regulatory frameworks (Items 4, 7A, 7C, 7E, 8, and 9)

e. technical studies and proposals (Items 9.1d, 9.3, and eirp mask for 6425-7025 MHz)

f. Agenda for the next WRC (Item -6)

A total of 60 proposals were submitted by various sub-groups formed under committees 4, 5, and 6,
demonstrating the intense focus and diverse range of issues under consideration. Additionally, 40
proposals were submitted to the Editorial Committee for further review and potential inclusion in the
final documents presented during the WRC-23 Plenary Meeting, which was scheduled for the
closing week of the conference. This significant volume of proposals highlights the crucial role
played by committees 4, 5, and 6 in shaping the future of radio-communication technologies and
regulations at the international level. Their diligent work throughout the third week paved the way
for comprehensive discussions and potential decisions during the final phase of WRC-23. With a
substantial number of proposals still pending, the WRC-23 conference faces the prospect of
weekend sessions and extended working hours throughout the remaining weekdays, to achieve
meaningful progress on the diverse agenda items and finalize critical decisions. IAFI delegates
extended their full support to Indian administration, to significantly contribute and for active
participation in most of the deliberations.

Challenging tasks assigned to Committee-4: Major technical work of WRC-23 was carried out in
three committees as 4, 5 and 6. Committee -4, dealt with all important issues pertaining all
terrestrial services including IMT, Aeronautical, and Maritime mobile services etc. Three Working
Groups (WG-4A, 4B and 4C) under COM4, which were actively deliberating on the issues allocated
to COM4, completed their tasks and submitted their outcomes to COM 4. Shri Bharat Bhatia,
President, IAFI as a Vice-Chairperson and the sole representative from the Indian subcontinent to
hold such a position, started considering all the outcomes of the working groups and continued to
meet during the entire weekend to achieve consensus on critical issues. Significant progress was
achieved during the third week of WRC- 23, adopting texts for five key agenda items: 1.6, 1.10,
1.11, and 9.1(b). These finalized texts underwent review by the Editorial Committee before being
presented to the Plenary Meeting for final approval. Total eight proposals have been finalized and
send to the editorial committee by the Committee-4 till date

Meeting of IAFI delegates participating in WRC-23 at Dubai: Meanwhile on December 6th,
2023, IAFI delegates attending WRC-23 in Dubai were invited for a strategic meeting during the
event. The objective was to review the progress on issues previously discussed and formulate a
comprehensive strategy for tackling remaining topics likely to be addressed in upcoming meetings.
This proactive approach ensures IAFI remains at the forefront of IMT and Satellite systems
developments, poised to effectively advocate for the best interests of its members and contribute to
a thriving global telecommunications landscape.

CPM Meeting at Dubai: Shortly after the closing of the WRC-23 on 15th Dec, 2023, the
international telecommunications community gathered in Dubai for CPM27-1, a two-day conference
preparatory meeting for WRC-27 on December 18th and19th, 2023. Hosted by the UAE's
Telecommunications and Digital Government Regulatory Authority (TDRA). The meeting brought
together delegates from around the world to organize the necessary studies for the upcoming
WRC-27 and WRC-31, the key ITU conferences in future that will shape the future of radio
spectrum allocation, impacting everything from satellite communications to mobile technology. The
agenda for WRC-27 includes a wide range of topics, such as:

a. Allocation of spectrum for new and emerging technologies, such as 5G and 6G including non-terrestrial
networks (NTN) for promoting ubiquitous connectivity using NGSO satellites

b. Management of satellite orbits and allocation of spectrum to satellite services

c. Development of new technical standards for radio-communication systems

d. Protection of radio-communication systems from interference

The CPM27-1 meeting proved an important step in preparing for WRC-27. It provided an
opportunity for delegates to discuss the key issues that will be on the agenda and to start
developing proposals for new regulations. Major key outcomes of the CPM27-1 meeting were

a. Agreement on the studies for various agenda items of WRC-27

b. Assigning each WRC-27 agenda item to one or more responsible ITU working parties to study specific
agenda items

c. Assigning contributing ITU working parties to each WRC-27 agenda item.

d. Development of a preliminary timetable for WRC-27 studies

e. Assigning initial working parties to collect information about WRC-31 agenda items.

The CPM27-1 meeting was a successful first step in the preparations for WRC-27. The meeting
was well-attended and productive and it laid the foundation for a successful WRC-27.

Submission of comments on TRAI Consultation Paper regarding MWA, MWB, E and V Band:
The Telecom Regulatory Authority of India (TRAI) issued a comprehensive Consultation Paper on
spectrum allocation, seeking stakeholder feedback on a complex set of 61 questions. This
document, covering the assignment of spectrum in E&V bands and for Microwave Access (MWA) &
Microwave Backbone (MWB), demanded thorough analysis. The IAFI examined the paper and
circulating draft comments to its members for their valuable inputs. The comments received from
the members were incorporated and consolidated reply was furnished to TRAI on 13-12-2023. IAFI
supported the administrative allotment of spectrum to TSPs in MWA, MWB and E-Band and
unlicensing of the entire V-Band.

IAFI Radio Group meeting for WP-5D: December 22nd, 2023, saw the IAFI Radio Group
convening in a meeting in the hybrid format to strategize and prepare contributions for the
upcoming 45th WP-5D meeting. The Members focused on identifying opportunities for IAFI to
actively participate in the meeting, scheduled for January 31st to February 7th, 2024, in Geneva,
Switzerland. Members discussed the outstanding issues of 44th WP-5D meeting and potential
agenda items for the forthcoming 45th WP-5D. After comprehensive deliberation, 10 key issues
were identified by IAFI for contribution submissions, considering IAFI’s commitment for active
participation in the upcoming meeting WP-5D meeting. The last date to submit the contribution in
the upcoming WP-5D will be 23-01-2023.

WTSA-24: The ITU-T’s mega event, World Telecommunication Standardization Assembly 2024
(WTSA-24), is scheduled to be held from October 15 to October 24, 2024, in New Delhi, India.
WTSA-24, likely to be held at prestigious Bharat Mandapam at Pragati Maidan, New Delhi, India
from 15th to 24th Oct, 2024. Bharat Mandapam was recently inaugurated in Sept, 2023, a grand
architectural marvel located at ITPO complex in Pragati Maidan, New Delhi and venue for the first
event, G-20. The last event, WTSA-20, was planned to be arranged in India, but due to the COVID-
19 pandemic, event was relocated to Geneva, Switzerland. Finally, WTSA-20 was held from 1st
March to 9th March, 2022, preceded by the Global Standards Symposium on February 28, 2022.
The forthcoming WTSA-24 is going to play a pivotal role in addressing the evolving landscape of
telecommunication standards, fostering international collaboration, and navigating the industry's
response to the on-going global challenges. IAFI has been regularly coordinating with its industry
partners and members, TEC/DoT, to make WTSA-24 the most successful event and ensure its
resounding success.

Meeting arranged by TEC for the WTSA-24 preparations: IAFI participated in a meeting
arranged by TEC, New Delhi, under the leadership of Sr DDG (TEC), for discussing the preparation
for the pivotal World Telecommunication Standardization Assembly 2024 (WTSA-24), scheduled to
be held from October 15 to October 24, 2024, in New Delhi, India. The meeting was attended by
various key stakeholders from DoT, TEC, academia, and the industry. The meeting commenced
with a comprehensive presentation by Shri Avinash Agrawal, DDG (Standardization), TEC outlining
the significance of WTSA-24 and India's potential contributions. The main aim of the meeting was to
finalize contributions from India for the forthcoming APT Preparatory Group meeting for WTSA-24
(APT WTSA-24-2), likely to be held from 5th and 6th February, 2024. Mr. Bharat Bhatia, President,
IAFI actively participated in the discussions and agreed to contribute in more than 20 resolutions.
IAFI also expressed its full support to make WTSA-24 most successful, ensuring the India's voice is
heard loud and clear at this landmark event. To solidify India's contributions to the upcoming APT
WTSA-24-2 meeting, IAFI proposed a collaborative session on January 10, 2024, at CSOI, along
with networking Lunch and Tea etc. Sr DDG (TEC) welcomed IAFI's proposal and thanked for the
initiative to make WTSA-24 the most successful event.

IAFI new contribution to restructure WP-5Dz: IAFI has been actively involved in the various
activities of the ITU and regularly contributes for the development and evolution of IMT, Satellite,
Aeronautical/Maritime communication systems. Recently, IAFI submitted a new contribution (No.
1257) to Working Party 5D (WP-5D) proposing to streamline the structure and working process of
the WP-5D, for discussing and deliberating the issues and submitting the proposals to the next RA-
27 and WRC-27. WP-5D plays a crucial role in the overall radio system aspects of IMT,
encompassing existing and future generations, including IMT-2000, IMT-Advanced, IMT-2020, IMT-
2030, and beyond. The recent WRC-23 witnessed vibrant discussions exploring the diverse
platforms leveraging IMT technology. Looking ahead, several new agenda items for WRC-27 will
involve IMT as a key stakeholder. This underscores the critical need for WP-5D to prioritize
compatibility and coexistence studies to ensure seamless integration and optimal performance
across the expanding IMT ecosystem. IAFI's contribution effectively addresses this challenge by
proposing a more efficient structure and working process for WP-5D. This initiative demonstrates
IAFI's unwavering commitment to spearheading the advancement of IMT and ensuring its continued
success in driving global connectivity.

The World Radiocommunication Conference 2023 (WRC-23): The International
Telecommunication Union's (ITU) premier event, the World Radiocommunication Conference 2023
(WRC-23), was held in Dubai World Trade Centre, United Arab Emirates, from November 20 to
December 15, 2023. The distinguished Telecommunications and Digital Government Regulatory
Authority (TDRA) of the UAE hosted the event. The conference gathered over 4,000 participants
from more than 172 countries and territories, including international organizations, inter-
governmental organizations, recognized operating agencies, scientific and industrial organizations,
financial and development institutions, and other entities actively engaged in telecommunication
matters. The participation of a diverse array of countries from across the globe underscored the
conference's international significance and the collective commitment to ensuring the efficient and
equitable allocation of this precious resource. The WRC-23 commenced on November 20, 2023, in
Dubai, UAE, convening government representatives for negotiations on the allocation of radio-
frequency spectrum. His Highness Sheikh Ahmed bin Mohammed bin Rashid Al Maktoum, Second
Deputy Ruler of Dubai, graced the WRC23 opening ceremony. In a message from United Nations
Secretary-General, António Guterres added that radio frequencies, whether on earth or in space,
form the backbone of advanced communications for all of humanity. From education to healthcare,
from agriculture to climate monitoring, expanding radio-communication services and bridging the
digital divide is key to reducing inequalities and advancing the Sustainable Development Goals.
Doreen Bogdan-Martin, ITU Secretary-General said that radio-communications are at the top of the
global agenda. Equitably managed spectrum and the associated satellite orbits are among the best
tools in our toolbox to make good on our commitment to build a digital future that works for
everyone and for our planet.

Shri Bhatia, President IAFI appointed as Vice-chair for WRC-23 work: The Secretary-General,
ITU, through a document dated 20-11-2023, announced the appointment of Chair and
ViceChairpersons for the committees established to ensure the seamless operation of the WRC-23.
Notably, Shri Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI was appointed as the Vice-Chairperson for Committee-
4. He was the sole representative from India or the entire Indian subcontinent to hold such a
position, highlighting his significant role in the WRC23 proceedings. It is crucial to note that
Committee-4 holds responsibility for addressing some of the most sensitive matters for WRC-23.
These include the examination of frequency band 4 800-4 990 MHz, safeguarding stations of
aeronautical and maritime mobile services, and evaluating the identification of frequency bands
such as 3 300-3 400 MHz, 3 600-3 800 MHz, 6 425-7 025 MHz, 7 025-7 125 MHz, and 10.0-10.5
GHz for International Mobile Telecommunications (IMT). Additionally, Committee-4 is tasked with
deliberating on issues related to High-Altitude Platform Stations (HIBS) for IMT, aeronautical and
maritime mobile services, Global Maritime Distress and Safety System (GMDSS), amateur service,
amateur-satellite service, and various other critical concerns.

Activities performed during the second week of WRC-23: Strengthening India's presence at
WRC-23, a contingent of Indian delegates, led by Member (Technology), DCC arrived since the
start of the second week. Joined by a team of officers from DoT/WPC, representatives from the
Indian Space Research Organisation (ISRO), and the President of IAFI, this expanded delegation
bolstered India's active participation in the conference.

Bilateral meeting between India and ITU regarding upcoming WTSA-2024: The World
Telecommunication Standardization Assembly 2024 (WTSA-24), a quadrennial event, a crucial
platform for the ITU-T, is scheduled to be held from October 15 to October 24, 2024, in New Delhi,
India. WTSA-24 represents a significant milestone in shaping global telecommunications standards.
Last event, WTSA-20, faced challenges posed by the COVID-19 pandemic, leading to its relocation
to Geneva, Switzerland. Last event was occurred from March 1 to March 9, 2022, preceded by the
Global Standards Symposium on February 28, 2022. The forthcoming WTSA-24 is poised to play a
pivotal role in addressing the evolving landscape of telecommunication standards, fostering
international collaboration, and navigating the industry's response to on going global challenges. A
bilateral meeting was held at Dubai, UAE, to discuss the preparations of WTSA-24. India was
wellrepresented at the meeting by a distinguished delegation including Shri Neeraj Mittal, Secretary,
DoT; Shri Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI; Shri V.J. Christopher, Wireless Advisor; Ms M Revathi,
JWA; Shri Arun Kumar and Shri Amit Gulati, DWA. On the ITU side, Mr. Mario Maniewicz, Director
of the Radiocommunication Bureau (BR); Dr. Cosmas Luckyson Zavazava, Director of the
Telecommunication Development Bureau (BDT); and Mr. Seizo Onoe, Director of the
Telecommunication Standardization Bureau (TSB) represented the organization. The meeting
served as an important platform for fostering constructive dialogue and coordination between India
and the ITU, facilitating discussions on bilateral issues, and laying the groundwork for preparations
leading up to the WTSA-24.

The Joint meeting organized by WWRF, IAFI and TII with Secretary General, ITU: WWRF, TII
and IAFI organized a joint meeting with the Secretary General, ITU at Dubai, UAE on 21-11-2023,
to discuss the various future challenges related to radio communication, International Mobile
Telecommunications (IMT), satellite communication, and issues pertaining to aeronautical and
maritime mobile services. WWRF stands out as a distinctive forum where the wireless community
collaboratively addresses pivotal research challenges, aiming to promote research initiatives that
foster unbounded communications to tackle key societal challenges in the future. All participants
expressed a mutual commitment to fostering collaboration on research, development, and policy
initiatives to address the identified challenges. Meeting proved a valuable platform for exchanging
insights, addressing challenges, and fostering collaboration between WWRF, TII, IAFI, and ITU. The
organizations expressed their gratitude for the opportunity to engage in constructive dialogue and
look forward to continued collaboration on critical issues in the field of telecommunications.

Dinner reception organized by WWRF/IAFI on 24-11-2023: The World Wireless Research
Foundation (WWRF), in collaboration IAFI, organized a networking dinner on 24-11-2023 in Dubai,
coinciding with the World Radiocommunication Conference 2023 (WRC-23). The dinner attracted
delegates from diverse countries, representatives from various industries, and senior figures from
the International Telecommunication Union (ITU), including the Secretary-General of ITU.

The Radiocommunication Assembly-2023 (RA-23) meeting held at Dubai 13-17, Nov, 2023:
The Radiocommunication Assembly 2023 (RA-23) was held in Dubai, UAE, from 13th to 17th
November, 2023. Shri Bharat Bhatia-President, IAFI, Shri Jitendra Singh-Vice President, IAFI along
with other IAFI members actively participated in the meeting, to support Indian delegation. The
Meeting was attended by over 1,500 delegates from over 150 countries. The prestigious
Radiocommunication Assembly is the supreme organ of the Radiocommunication Sector (ITU-R) of
the International Telecommunication Union (ITU). It is responsible for the technical and operational
aspects of radio communications, including the allocation of the radiofrequency spectrum and the
development of technical standards. The delegates discussed and adopted the wide range of
issues, including future of spectrum allocation for mobile broadband services, such as 5G and
beyond, development of new technologies for spectrum sharing, spectrum for satellite
communications, protection of radio frequencies from harmful interference and development of
standards for radio equipment. The RA-23 was ended with a resounding success, yielding a series
of critical decisions that will undoubtedly shape the future of radio communications. Despite the
severe rain and thunderstorms that plagued the UAE, causing a delay in the commencement of the
last day of the plenary session, the event proceeded with full of enthusiasm.

2nd 6G Summit organized by TII at Abu Dhabi, UAE: Technology Innovation Institute (TII)
organized a 2nd 6G Summit-2023 from 16th to 17th Nov, 2023 at Abu Dhabi. TII is a global
research centre and the pillar of Abu Dhabi's Advanced Technology Research Council (UAE). 6G
Summit invited experts from the global scientific and research communities, industry leaders, and
standardization bodies, working on the cutting edge of wireless technologies, to provide
international exposure for local initiatives in the field and create opportunities for valuable
collaborations with leading institutions and companies. Shri Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI was
invited as guest speaker and presented a structured and informative talk on the topic “Beyond
Connectivity, Towards a Connected Intelligent Society”, a significant accomplishment for Shri Bhatia
and to the IAFI community.

IAFI Radio Group meeting regarding three Consultation Papers released by TRAI: IAFI Radio
Group meeting was held on 02-11-2023 at IAFI office in hybrid mode, to discuss the views of the
members on the draft comments circulated to all members. Draft comments on the following three
Consultation Papers were circulated and it was decided to hold a meeting on Thursday 2nd
November at 12 PM IST at the IAFI office to discuss and finalize our draft response to

1. TRAI’s Consultation Paper on Assignment of Spectrum in E&V Bands, and Spectrum for Microwave
Access (MWA) & Microwave Backbone (MWB)

2. Consultation Paper on Open and De-licensed use of Unused or Limited Used Spectrum Bands for
Demand Generation for Limited Period in Tera-Hertz Range.

3. Consultation Paper on Review of Terms and Conditions of PMRTS and CMRTS Licenses. Draft
comments were discussed in details and it was decided to write to TRAI, to seek extension of last date
of submission of comments regarding Consultation Papers on MWA/MWB and Tera Hertz spectrum
and send the updated comments to TRAI regarding PMRTS/CMRTS.

Digital India: Achievements and challenges: Shree Bharat Bhatia President IAFI participated in a
panel-discussions on achievements and challenges of Digital India initiative of the Hon’ble prime
minister of India organised by the Doordarshan. The discussions was telecast on DD in the coming
weeks.

India Mobile Congress - 2023 (IMC-2023): Hon’ble Prime Minister, Shri Narendra Modi on 27-10-
2023 inaugurated 7th India Mobile Congress (IMC), at Bharat Mandapam in New Delhi. He
highlighted India’s rapid 5G rollout, as a model for other countries to follow. He emphasized that
India did not halt after the success of 5G and took on the work of taking it to every individual. Prime
Minister also informed that within one year of 5G rollout, 4 lakh 5G base stations has been
deployed, covering more than 97 percent of the cities and 80 percent of the population. The
threeday India Mobile Congress – 2023 held from 27-10-2023 to 29-10-2023, showcased the latest
digital innovations including 5G, 6G, IoT, AI, broadcasting, satellite, and semiconductor
manufacturing, ideas, and use cases across key industries and sectors. It was Asia's largest digital
technology forum, where voice, data, and a billion people converged. The event was attended by
more than 250 global speakers, 400+ exhibitors, 1000+ media personnel, and 100,000+ visitors
including delegates, student and academia, MSMEs, and government representatives. Mr Bharat
Bhatia, President and many other members of IAFI attended the inaugural ceremony. The event
also featured a comprehensive conference program with keynote addresses and panel discussions
from industry leaders and experts. Mr Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI also delivered a presentation
on the topic “Need for Evolution of Auction Designs & other Market Mechanisms for Optimal
Allocation & Utilization of Spectrum” and also participated in the panel discussions on the subject.
His presentation highlighted the need for next spectrum reforms including spectrum swapping
policy, lowering of reserve prices for bands below 1 GHz, delicensing of 6GHz and spectrum
harmonization.

3rd India Spectrum Management Conference, ISMC-23: IAFI, along with the University of
Chicago, SpectrumX, and IIT Delhi jointly hosted a very successful three-day mega event, the “3rd
India Spectrum Management Conference” in New Delhi, from 16th to 18th Oct, 2023, on Spectrum
& Telecommunications Policy and Technology for Future Wireless Systems. The comprehensive
three-day conference delved into the intricacies of spectrum policies, issues, and challenges,
charting a path for the future of wireless systems. It featured in-depth sessions on spectrum
planning across various frequency bands, encompassing Sub-1 GHz, 1-6 GHz, 6-7 GHz, 7-24 GHz,
and bands above 24 GHz, including THz frequencies. Day-1 of the event was held at UChicago
Delhi Centre, with inaugural address by Dr Monisha Ghosh, Professor, Electrical Engineering,
University of Notre Dame, USA and Mr. Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI and keynote Speeches by
Mr. Charles Cooper, Associate Administrator, Office of Spectrum Management, NTIA, USA and Shri
VJ Christopher, Wireless Advisor to the Govt. of India. The Day-2 & 3 of the event was held at Le
Meridian with inaugural address by prominent dignitaries viz Dr Monisha Ghosh, Prof Rajeev
Shorey, Professor, IIT Delhi, Shri V J Christopher, Wireless Advisor, Mr. Charles Cooper, Associate
Administrator, Office of Spectrum Management, NTIA, USA, Smt. Gunjan Dave, Member
(Technology), DCC, DoT, Shri Manish Sinha, Member (Finance), DCC, DoT and Prof. Abhay
Karandikar, Secretary, Department of Science and Technology (DST), India. The conference was a
big success, with robust participation of attendees from all over the world, that enabled the event to
achieve its main aim of bringing together senior government officials from DoT, TEC, BSNL, TRAI,
ISRO, and DoS, as well as industry experts and regulators from India and many other countries and
fostered a collaborative environment for addressing the complexities of spectrum allocation and
utilization, ensuring the seamless evolution of wireless technologies and WRC-23 & WRC-27
issues. The Conference was well covered by the media.

Meeting of National Preparatory Committee (NPC) for WRC-23: A meeting of the National
Preparatory Committee (NPC) for WRC-23 was held on 19-10-2023 at Spectrum Room, Sanchar
Bhawan, New Delhi, under the chairmanship of Wireless Advisor, DoT, to discuss the draft proposal
of India, for the upcoming WRC-23. Mr Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI and Mr. Jitendra Singh, Vice
President, participated in the meeting. WRC-23 draft proposals AI 1.2, 1.3, 1.4 (Band-A), 1.5, 1.7,
1.8, 1.11 (Issue-c), 1.12, 1.13, 1.15, 1.16, 7, 8 and 10 were discussed in details. In addition, two
draft proposals directly received by the NPC, AI 1.2 (6425 –7025 MHz) of COAI and AI 1.10
(Frequency bands for IMT) of GSA, were also discussed. However, there was no support for the
COAI proposal on 6GHz for IMT and it was agreed to maintain India’s opposition to this proposal.

Letter to Secretary, DoT regarding formulation of a new Policy for Spectrum Swapping: IAFI
in a letter to Secretary, DoT requested to formulate a policy allowing TSPs to swap the existing
spectrum in one band with another band that they need, while being revenue neutral to revenue
positive to the exchequer. Considering spectrum as a scarce natural resource and needs to be
utilized efficiently, and to provide the best service to the consumers, IAFI suggested an innovative
idea of spectrum swapping, for more efficient spectrum utilization, to increase investment in mobile
infrastructure, improving competition, and ultimately better services to the consumers. It is
proposed that the DoT should allow swapping of spectrum held by TSPs in one band with spectrum
available with the Government in other bands, as it will help service providers to consolidate their
spectrum holdings in the bands, where they needed the most, and to free up spectrum in the
bands, where not using it efficiently, thereby improving the spectrum efficiency. Entire process will
be either revenue neutral or positive to the Government and TSPs has to pay the difference of
mount, which can be calculated based on the last auction-determine price or as per the prevailing
market rates, if the auction determined price is more than a year old.

Meeting of Study Group -5 (SG-5) held at Geneva from 25th to 26th Sept, 2023: President IAFI
participated in the Meeting of SG-5 on 25th and 26th Sept, 2023 in Geneva to approve and adopt
the finalized draft new recommendation containing the Framework for 6G. WP5D during its 44th
meeting in June 2023 had adopted the proposals of IAFI/India and other countries, after four years
of extensive deliberations. The agreed framework containing the usage scenario, ubiquitous
connectivity, capabilities, coverage, interoperability and sustainability of IMT2030 (6G) is contained
in the finalized draft new recommendation was developed by WP5D through a consensus building
process and was forwarded to SG 5 for adoption towards approval. This draft new recommendation
is very valuable for administrations and global industry to help focus on their research and
development efforts towards IMT 2030 and any delay in the approval can lead to ambiguity among
various research programs and corresponding technology development efforts. Issue was again
discussed during SG-5 plenary meeting in detail and draft recommendations were finally adopted
and approved to send the same to upcoming WRC-23 event at Dubai. In addition to the above, one
more draft new report of IAFI/India regarding IMTApplications, utilizing IMT-2020 technologies for
wide range of industrial and enterprise usage and applications was also discussed in detail and
adopted and approved by SG-5 plenary, to send the same to upcoming WRC-23. This was
developed by the SWG-Applications chaired by Mr. Bharat Bhatia and the drafting group under the
chairmanship of Shri Jitendra Singh, VP, IAFI Similarly, another draft new report of IAFI/India, viz
IMT- Multimedia, regarding the capabilities of the terrestrial component of IMT-2020 technologies
for multimedia communications, including real-time multimedia interactive applications was also
discussed in detail and adopted and approved by SG-5 plenary, to send the same to upcoming
WRC-23.

Media Showcase: Following Items relating to IAFI were covered in the media

1. ITU agrees to open new 6 GHz spectrum band for 5G, 6G services

2. India's strengthening participation in the ITU premier event, the WRC-23, Dubai

3. IAFI calls abolition of CMRTS licenses

4. IAFI calls for spectrum swap for mobile operators

5. ITU-APT joint spectrum conference with University of Chicago and IIT Delhi, ISMC-23 concludes
after 3 days of hectic discussions on key spectrum opportunities and challenges

6. DOT and TRAI Announce Auction of 10 Spectrum Bands for 5G at the 3rd India Spectrum
Management Conference Organized by IAFI and University of Chicago

7. IAFI urges TRAI to allow market forces to respond to OTT services

8. IAFI calls for priority to consumers' internet needs in the 6GHz discussions

9. IAFI calls for dedicated spectrum for Industrial 5G networks

10. India at cusp of convergence of landline, wireless services: DoT

11. 6th National Preparatory Workshop for WRC-23

12. IAFI counter comments on the TRAI Consultation for satellite spectrum

13. ITU Approves 6G Vision Framework

14. ITU approves Bharat 6G vision framework

15. ITU reaches agreement to open new 6GHz band for 5G & 6G

16. ITU agrees to open new 6 GHz spectrum band for 5G, 6G services

UPCOMING EVENT

Links to our Activities & Programmes

1) Letter to Secretary DoT & Chairman DCC Suggestions for formulation of a new Policy for
Spectrum Swapping

2) Letter to Minister of External Affairs on Delicensing of 6GHz band

3) Letter to Secretary DoT on Important issues awaiting solution in the telecom sector

4) Letter to DDG TEC for Nomination to join the member of TSAC

5) Letter to MOC on Policy for 5G Network for Industries

6) 44th Working Party 5D Summary

7) IAFI Comments on In-Space Draft guidelines for implementation of the Indian Space Policy
2023

8) Request for amendment of NFAP-2022/IND 16 for removal of frequency band 27-50 – 28.50
GHz for the use of IMT/5G on primary basis

9) Letter to MOS on 6G standardisation Roadmap

10) Suggestions of the IAFI on TRAI’s recommendations on 'Licensing Framework for
Establishing and Operating Satellite Earth Station Gateway (SESG)

IAFI MEMBERSHIP
ITU-APT Foundation of India (IAFI) is a non-profit, non-political, non-partisan Industry foundation
registered as a society under the Societies Registration Act, 1960. IAFI has been working for the
last 20 years with the prime objective of encouraging the involvement of professionals, corporate,
public/private sector industries, R&D organizations, academic institutions, and such other agencies
engaged in the development of Indian Telecom sector. The 17th Executive Council meeting (EC) of
IAFI was held on July 21, 2023, at IAFI office, Barakhamba Road. The EC welcomed 2 new
corporate members and 1 individual member to the EC which has been overseeing the increased
work load in ITU & APT Activities. This addition, takes corporate members to 22 and individual
members to 130 and making a total of 152 members. The EC also emphasized on the Creation of a
new member category for academia and a campaign to register Eminent educational institutes as
members.
The benefits provided to the members include an invitation to all the events of the Foundation which
include: Training programs, seminars, workshops, etc. conducted by the society on a
complimentary basis. Besides, EC Members will also have access to information related to ITU and
APT and other telecom journals where members can subscribe. Members are further eligible to
participate in ITU-T, ITU-D, and APT activities. The individual Membership Fee of IAFI has been
reversed to the previous fee that was applicable since the beginning. Please click: Membership
details

Activities in our focus areas during November 2023

First meeting of the Focus Group - Costing Models (FG-CD) for Affordable Data Services: The first
meeting of the FOCUS GROUP (FG) on Costing of Data to study and explore the various costing
models for providing affordable data services was held in new Delhi India on 05th to 06th October,
2023. This focus group has been created by the ITU-T SG3 based on an initiative by the IAFI. It
may be recalled that IAFI had submitted a contribution number SG-3-C028 in SG3 of ITU-T
meeting, held on 11- 11-2022, with a proposal to create a FOCUS GROUP (FG) on Costing of Data
to study and explore the various costing models for providing affordable data services. Initially
countries from several regions found interest in the proposal and recognized its importance, to
study the costing models, as a standardized benchmarking model as currently not available.
However, some countries wanted to see the detailed Term of Reference (ToR) of the FG. Therefore,
IAFI re-submitted the proposal jointly with Indian Administration, TRAI and TCOE, in the SG-3
meeting (SG-3-C64), held in March, 2023. Meeting agreed to create a new Focus Group on costing
medal for the affordable data services, under the chairmanship of Shri Shailendra Kumar Mishra of
India. The ITU and the TRAI also organized a workshop on “Cost Models for Data Services and
International Internet Connectivity”, on 4 th October 2023 at Lalit Hotel, New Delhi.

IAFI has submitted an information contribution on the spectrum needs of Programme Making &
Special Events (PMSE) Industry to the upcoming 6th meeting of the APT Conference Preparatory
Group for WRC-23 (APG23-6) being held from 14th to 19th August 2023 at Brisbane, Australia
under Agenda Item 1.5 of WRC- 23. Shri Bharat Bhatia, President, IAFI and Shri Jitendra Singh,
Vice President will physically join the meeting along with Indian delegation. Many IAFI delegates will
attend the meeting virtually. Programme Making & Special Events (PMSE) includes wireless
applications used in making professional audio/video/film etc. and staging or performance of
concerts, musicals entertainment, meetings, conferences, cultural and educational activities, trade
fairs, sport, religious, and many types of public or private events. IAFI through this contribution
provided information on the spectrum challenges faced by the PMSE industry worldwide, as
available spectrum for PMSE applications below 1 GHz, has been shrinking over time, due to
deployments of 3G, 4G and 5G mobile services

The Department of Telecommunications (DoT) has extended Machine-to-Machine (M2M) and
Wireless Personal Area Network as also Wireless Local Area Network (WPAN/WLAN) registration
to all entities engaged in such businesses. DoT has said that non-compliance may lead to
withdrawal or disconnection of telecom resources obtained from the authorised telecom licensees.
Accordingly, it said, all business entities (companies, government departments, organisations,
partnership firms, LLPs, institutions, undertakings, proprietorship firms, societies and trusts)
engaged in M2M service provisioning and WPAN/WLAN connectivity provisioning are advised to
register with DoT "through a simple and transparent online process" via SaralSanchar portal.

TRAI Consultation Paper regarding review of PMRTS/CMRTS license: The Telecom Regulatory
Authority of India (TRAI) released a consultation paper on August 29, 2023, to review the terms and
conditions of PMRTS and CMRTS licenses. The last date for submitting comments from
stakeholders was September 26, 2023, but was later extended to October 24, 2023 based on IAFI
request. Draft comments have been prepared by IAFI and circulated to all the members of the IAFI,
to solicit their views and suggestions by October 10, 2023. TRAI had invited comments on the
following three Consultation Papers, as detailed below.

1. Consultation Paper on Assignment of Spectrum in E&V Bands, and Spectrum for Microwave
Access (MWA) & Microwave Backbone (MWB).

2. Consultation Paper on Open and De-licensed use of Unused or Limited Used Spectrum Bands
for Demand Generation for Limited Period in Tera-Hertz Range.

3. Consultation Paper on Review of Terms and Conditions of PMRTS and CMRTS Licenses.

4. Draft comments were circulated to all members for comments and it is planned to hold a meeting
of stakeholders on 2nd November at the IAFI office to discuss and finalize our draft response to
TRAI.
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